




The aim of the company at the start was very 
simple: to carry out applied research to create new 
varieties of wheat. It was not envisaged that 
Agrovegetal would sell anything, because the 
company's owners (the farming cooperatives) were 
the ones who would exploit the products and were 
competing among themselves: they sold seeds and 
competed in the market. But after 6 or 7 years 
researching and collaborating together under the 
Agrovegetal umbrella, when their new products 
(new varieties of seed) appeared, they decided to 
commercialize them together. 

The aim has always been to produce high-quality 
and high-yielding varieties (wheat and later 
legumes) in order to break the existing market 
prevalence of poor-quality and cheaper varieties. 

Agrovegetal's competitors normally have one 
single point from which to select and produce all 
their varieties. That makes their logistics 
complicated. The strategy employed has been to 
establish strategic collaborations with public 
institutions (research and cooperatives) as well as 
private companies (usually manufacturers who 
purchase the end product) to make sure that 
everyone is working towards a common goal. 

Commercialization and follow-up 

Ignacio Selfs approached the pasta manufacturer 
GALLO S.L. in order to ask them to test the quality 
of different durum wheats. They agreed, and after 
3-4 years of having this relationship, the owner of
GALLO asked if they could buy a 10% participation
in Agrovegetal. For GALLO it was extremely
interesting to have the varieties of wheat being
produced of the quality that they want for pasta
manufacturing. Instead of having to fund their own
R&D department, they could get a better service
and results by paying a participation in
Agrovegetal, plus assured quantities of grain every
year. This relationship provided Agrovegetal with a
strong market position, and has ensured that their
strategy to produce new, high quality durum wheat
varieties paid off. They now have the second
leading variety in the market in Spain with a 25%
market share.

Agrovegetal has tried to achieve something similar 
in the market of common wheat, but they have not 
found a company that values quality as much as 
GALLO. They signed agreements which later were 
not fulfilled. This is combined with the technical 
problem that it is more difficult to reach high 
standards of quality with this type of wheat and 
obtain high yielding crops. Their main competitor 
(Limagrain) holds 70% of the market in Spain, and 
there is also a tendency to import large quantities 
of common wheat grain from abroad. In this 

market area therefore they have not succeeded in 
promoting varieties of high quality. Currently they 
have around an 8% share of the common wheat 
market. 

Agrovegetal has also branched out into working 
with chickpeas, peas and beans. Here the 
innovation process has been curtailed by a lack of 
funding and backing from key partners, and 
success has only been partial in the case of 
chickpeas. 

From an original business plan which involved just 
creating new varieties but not selling them, the 
relationship with the partners grew to such an 
extent that they decided to commercialize the 
products together. Agrovegetal now creates the 
new varieties, produces them, commercializes and 
sells them. 

Agrovegetal holds the IPR on the genetics and is 
able to license to third parties. However the 
business model is interesting. Agrovegetal's 
partners are involved in the field trials of the new 
varieties, thereby ensuring that enough can be 
tested in the development phases. When they get 
to the stage of having certified seed first 
reproduction (R1 }, in order to scale-up to R2 (which 
is when the seeds are ready for 
commercialization}, each partner buys from the 
others those R1 seeds they are interested in in 
order to multiply them; then they choose the R2 
seeds they want to sell later. Since this is all done 
under the same company, each year they agree 
the sales price for the R1 and R2 seeds. 
Agrovegetal charges the cooperatives a fixed fee 
for every kilo of R1 and R2 produced, while the 
commercial profit margin is kept by the 
cooperatives. 

Agrovegetal sells in Spain and a very small amount 
in Portugal. The company does not envisage 
moving outside the Spanish market for two 
reasons: 

1. The varieties they produce are short-cycle
varieties which do not work well in climates
outside southern Spain. They could
function in Italy, but there the market is
already very closed.

2. The varieties would work well in northern
Africa, but since CIMMYT is a non-profit
organization and they already send their
lines free of charge to developing countries,
Selfs does not believe it ethical for
Agrovegetal to try to sell seeds to those
countries given the relationships involved.

Until 2012, Agrovegetal did not have any sales 
staff; the cooperatives sold the seeds. In 2012, the 
governing council approved the appointment of a 
sales representative for Agrovegetal to sell outside 






